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Princeton Satellite Systems, Inc.
Software License Agreement

 

PLEASE READ THIS DOCUMENT CAREFULLY BEFORE USING THE SOFTWARE. BY USING THE 
SOFTWARE YOU (the ÒLicenseeÓÑeither an individual or an entity) ARE AGREEING TO BE BOUND BY THE 
TERMS OF THIS AGREEMENT. IF YOU DO NOT AGREE TO THE TERMS OF THIS AGREEMENT, 
PROMPTLY RETURN THE UNUSED SOFTWARE TO THE PLACE WHERE YOU OBTAINED IT AND 
YOUR MONEY WILL BE REFUNDED. YOU MUST SIGN AND RETURN THIS LICENSE AGREEMENT.

 

 1. License

 

This license permits Licensee to install and use the ÒSoftwareÓ. ÒUseÓ means that a copy of any function in the 
Software is loaded into temporary memory or installed into the permanent memory of a computer, except that a copy 
installed on a network server for the sole purpose of distribution to other computers is not in ÒuseÓ. Licensee is 
responsible for limiting the number of concurrent users to the number licensed.

Software licensed to degree-granting educational institutes at Princeton Satellite SystemsÕ educational discount are 
further restricted to use in connection with on-campus computing facilities that are used solely in support of 
classroom instruction and research activities of students and teaching faculty. The right to use the Software for 
commercial purposes including off- campus consulting by teaching faculty and students, is expressly excluded.
If the Software has been provided for testing and evaluation purposes, the license for use of the Software shall 
terminate thirty (30) days after receipt. The Licensee must return the Software and Documentation and destroy all 
backup copies.

 

 2. Restrictions

 

The Software contains copyrighted material, trade secrets, and other proprietary material. Licensee shall not 
translate the Software or create derivative works based on the Software in whole or in part. Licensee shall not 
attempt to obtain the source code of any portions of the Software that are not provided in source code, in whole or in 
part, by reverse engineering, decompilation or disassembly.

 

 3. Termination

 

Princeton Satellite Systems, may terminate this Agreement and LicenseeÕs right to use the Software at any time with 
or without cause. This license will terminate immediately without notice from Princeton Satellite Systems if 
Licensee fails to comply with any provision of this License. Upon termination, Licensee, shall promptly return all 
copies of the Software and Documentation in LicenseeÕs possession or control, or promptly provide written 
certification of their destruction. Licensee shall not be entitled to any refund if this Agreement is terminated.

 

 4. Updates

 

This license grants Licensee all improvements, modifications, enhancements, or updates to the Software and 
Documentation for the period specified in Appendix A. This license does not grant Licensee any right, license, or 
interest in any improvements, modifications, enhancements, or updates to the Software and Documentation after the 
period specified in Appendix A except where specified by Princeton Satellite Systems in writing.

 

 5. Export Law Assurances

 

Licensee agrees and certifies that neither the Software, nor any direct product thereof, will be exported outside of the 
country of purchase, except as authorized in advance by Princeton Satellite Systems in writing, and as permitted by 
the laws and regulations of the United States. 
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 6. Government End Users

 

If this Software is acquired by or on behalf of a unit or agency of the United States Government, the following 
provisions apply:
(a) The Software and its documentation were developed at private expense, no part of them were developed with 
government funds, and no part of them are in the public domain.
(b) The Software is a trade secret of Princeton Satellite Systems for all purposes of the Freedom of Information Act.
(c) The Software is ÒRestricted Computer SoftwareÓ as that term is defined in Clause 52.227-19 in the Federal 
Acquisition Regulations (FAR) and is ÒCommercial Computer SoftwareÓ as that term is defined in Subpart 227.471 
of the Department of Defense Federal Acquisition Regulation Supplement (DFARS) and in all respects is 
proprietary data belonging solely to Princeton Satellite Systems.
(i) For units of the Department of Defense (DoD) this Software is classified as ÒCommercial Computer SoftwareÓ 
and the Government is acquiring only Òrestricted rightsÓ in the Software and its documentation as that term is 
defined in Clause 252.227-7013 (c) (1) of the DFARS, and
(ii) if the Software is supplied to any unit or agency of the United States Government other than DoD, the 
GovernmentÕs rights in the Software, and its documentation will be as defined in Clause 52.227-19 (c) (2) of the 
FAR or, in the case of NASA, in Clause 18-52.227-86(d) of the NASA Supplement to the FAR.
RESTRICTED RIGHTS LEGEND. Use, duplication, or disclosure by the Government is subject to restrictions as 
set forth in subparagraph (c) (1) (ii) of the Rights in Technical Data and Computer Software clause at DFARS 
252.227-7013. Manufacturer: Princeton Satellite Systems, Inc., 33 Witherspoon Street, Princeton, New Jersey, 
08542.

 

 7. Limited Warranty on Media

 

Princeton Satellite Systems warrants the media on which the Software is recorded to be free from defects in 
materials and workmanship under normal use for a period of ninety (90) days from the date of purchase as 
evidenced by a copy of the receipt. Princeton Satellite SystemsÕ entire liability and LicenseeÕs exclusive remedy will 
be replacement of the disk. THIS WARRANTY GIVES YOU SPECIFIC LEGAL RIGHTS, AND YOU MAY 
ALSO HAVE OTHER RIGHTS THAT VARY FROM STATE TO STATE.

 

 8. Limitation of Liability

 

UNDER NO CIRCUMSTANCES INCLUDING NEGLIGENCE, SHALL PRINCETON SATELLITE SYSTEMS 
BE LIABLE FOR ANY INCIDENTAL, SPECIAL OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES THAT RESULT FROM 
THE USE OR INABILITY TO USE THE SOFTWARE OR RELATED DOCUMENTATION, EVEN IF 
PRINCETON SATELLITE SYSTEMS OR AN AUTHORIZED REPRESENTATIVE OF PRINCETON 
SATELLITE SYSTEMS HAS BEEN ADVISED OF THE POSSIBILITY OF SUCH DAMAGES. SOME 
JURISDICTIONS DO NOT ALLOW THE LIMITATION OR EXCLUSIONS OF LIABILITY FOR 
INCIDENTAL OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES SO THE ABOVE LIMITATION OR EXCLUSION MAY 
NOT APPLY. In no event shall Princeton Satellite SystemsÕ total liability to Licensee for all damages, losses, and 
causes of action (whether in contract, tort (including negligence) or otherwise) exceed the amount paid by Licensee 
for the Software.

 

 9. IndemniÞcation

 

a) Licensee shall promptly notify Princeton Satellite Systems of any claim that the Software infringes a patent, 
copyright, trade secret or any other right of a third party, and will fully cooperate with Princeton Satellite Systems in 
any defense of such a claim. Princeton Satellite Systems will defend Licensee to the extent that the Software is 
involved, provided Licensee promptly notifies Princeton Satellite Systems in writing of the claim or of any 
threatened or actual suit. However, in no event shall Princeton Satellite Systems’ liability of Licensee for damages, 
costs or attorneyÕs fees exceed the total amount paid by Licensee to Princeton Satellite Systems for the license 
granted hereunder.
b) Licensee shall defend, indemnify and hold Princeton Satellite Systems harmless from any and all damages, 
liabilities, costs and expenses (including but not limited to attorneyÕs fees) incurred by Princeton Satellite Systems 
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as a result of any judgement or proceed against Princeton Satellite Systems arising out of or connected in any 
manner with the distribution or use of the Software, except for the rights defined above, provided that Princeton 
Satellite Systems, notifies Licensee of any such claim or proceeding in writing and tenders to Licensee the 
opportunity to defend or settle such claim or proceedings at its expense and cooperates with Licensee in defending 
or settling such claim or proceeding.

 

 10. Severability

 

Should any part or provision of this License be held unenforceable or in conflict with the law of any jurisdiction, the 
validity of the remaining parts or provisions shall not be affected by such holding.

 

 11. Governing Law

 

The validity and interpretation of this License shall be governed by the laws of the State of New Jersey, the Federal 
or State Courts located in the State of New Jersey shall have jurisdiction to hear any dispute under this License.

 

 12. Limitation on Effect of Waiver

 

A waiver of any breach of any provision of this License shall not be construed as a continuing waiver of other 
breaches of the same or of other provisions of this License.

 

 13. Entire AgreementÑModiÞcation to Be in Writing

 

This License constitutes the entire License for the Software and supersedes any prior agreement concerning the 
contents of this package. It shall not be modified except by written agreement dated subsequent to the date of this 
agreement and signed by an authorized Princeton Satellite Systems representative. Princeton Satellite Systems is not 
bound by any provision of any purchase order, receipt, acceptance, confirmation, correspondence, or otherwise, 
unless Princeton Satellite Systems specifically agrees to the provision in writing.

 

 14. Assignability

 

This License may not be transferred to any other party without the written consent of Princeton Satellite Systems. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have hereunto set their hands and seals.

 

Organization: Princeton Satellite Systems, Inc.

 

By: By:

Print Name: Print Name:      Michael A. Paluszek

Title: Title:                 President

Date: Date:
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Appendix A

 

Product(s) Stellar Attitude Determination Toolbox
Spacecraft Control Toolbox 3.0

License Type Professional

Start Date January 10, 2000

End Date January 10, 2001


